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Dream Oasis Villa with a View
Price:  USD 430.000

Location:  South Reward

Bathrooms:  2

Bedrooms:  3

Lot size:  798 m2

Built up size:  290 m2

Welcome to your dream oasis perched atop the scenic hill of South 
Reward in Sint Maarten!  This stunning 3-bedroom, 2.5-bathroom 
villa boasts unparalleled views of the valley with the ocean back 
drop stretching all the way to Saba giving you a breathtaking 
panoramic view. As you step into the expansive 290m² living space, 
you're greeted by the large and spacious open living area with an 
amazing large porch on the side. The current owner, a renowned 
local artist, makes this residence a truly one-of-a-kind purchase 
opportunity. Indulge in the ultimate relaxation as you unwind by 
the sparkling pool, which offers sweeping views of the lush valley 
below and captivating ocean views that extend all the way to Saba 
on clear days. Whether you're lounging poolside or enjoying an 
alfresco meal on the spacious terrace, every moment is imbued 
with tranquility and serenity. Inside, the villa exudes a seamless 
blend of modern comfort and Caribbean charm, with fantastic 
finishes and thoughtfully designed interiors. The open-concept 
layout flows effortlessly from the stylish living area to the gourmet 
kitchen, creating the perfect space for both intimate gatherings and 
grand entertaining. A nice feature is the pantry right next to the 
kitchen, also with access from the outside so no need to go through 
the living room with all your groceries. The poured concrete walls 
with it's laminated case makes it a very sturdy and strong home 
that will withstand anything. Having the hill backdrop will give the 
home a lot of comfort and support with also the 2 sides having no 
real neighbors so very quiet. The house is perched on a large 
798M2 piece of land with the opportunity to make another 
entrance from the lower road up giving the new owner the option 
to extend the current house with potentially another living area 
and large deck with the similar grand views. With its prime, up top, 
location and exquisite features, this exceptional property offers the 
epitome of island living. Don't miss your chance to own a piece of 
paradise in Sint Maarten – schedule your private viewing today and 
experience the allure of this magnificent villa for yourself.
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