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Exquisite Townhome - Zara Villa's - 
Saint Lucia
Price:  USD 850.000

Location:  Other

Bathrooms:  4

Bedrooms:  3

Lot size:  3 m2

Built up size:  3 m2

Luxurious 3 Bedroom, 4.5 Bathroom Townhome in Zara Villa's 
Condominium, Saint Lucia Welcome to the epitome of tropical 
luxury living in the heart of Saint Lucia – a stunning 3-bedroom, 4.5-
bathroom townhome nestled in the prestigious Zara Villa's 
Condominium. This exquisite and well designed residence is not 
just a home; it's a lifestyle investment for discerning families 
seeking comfort, security, and the enchanting allure of the 
Caribbean. Key Features: Spacious and Well-Appointed: The 
townhome boasts three generously sized bedrooms, each with its 
private bathroom, ensuring comfort and privacy for all residents. 
Outdoor Oasis: Enjoy the breathtaking beauty of Saint Lucia from 
all the private decks, providing the perfect setting for relaxation, 
entertainment, and soaking up the Caribbean sun. Plunge Pool: 
Dive into tranquility with your own private plunge pool, offering a 
refreshing escape from the tropical heat and an ideal spot to 
unwind with family and friends with a view to melt away with. Fully 
Furnished: This residence comes fully furnished, combining 
elegance with island-inspired décor to create a seamless blend of 
comfort, luxury and style. Family room: The lower level has been 
equipped with a spacious TV room for family entertainment which, 
if needed, could always be turned into another elegant bedroom 
with a private terrace. Gourmet Kitchen: The newly fitted kitchen 
features granite countertops and is fully equipped, making it a true 
haven for culinary enthusiasts. Whether you're preparing a quick 
snack or a gourmet meal, this kitchen has you covered. with the 
additional bar on the other side to have your audience looking at 
your every move on making heavenly dishes. Recreational 
Amenities: Embrace an active lifestyle with proximity to tennis 
courts and a golf course, ensuring there's always an opportunity for 
leisure and fitness right at your doorstep. Gated Community with 
24-Hour Security: Enjoy peace of mind with a secure and gated 
community, providing round-the-clock security for you and your 
loved ones. Discover Saint Lucia: Beyond the confines of your 
exquisite townhome, Saint Lucia beckons with a myriad of 
enchanting experiences. This picturesque island is renowned for its 
lush landscapes, pristine beaches, and warm, welcoming locals. 
Pitons: Marvel at the iconic Pitons, twin volcanic peaks rising 
dramatically from the Caribbean Sea, creating a stunning backdrop 
for your island lifestyle. Sulphur Springs: Indulge in the therapeutic 
waters of the Sulphur Springs, the Caribbean's only drive-in 
volcano, offering a unique and rejuvenating experience. Water 
Activities: Explore the crystal-clear waters through snorkeling, 
scuba diving, or sailing, discovering the vibrant marine life and 
hidden coves. Culinary Delights: Immerse yourself in the rich 
culinary scene, savoring the flavors of fresh seafood, tropical fruits, 
and local delicacies. Cultural Experiences: Engage with the vibrant 
local culture through music festivals, street parties, and traditional 
events, celebrating the island's unique heritage. In summary, this 3-
bedroom, 4.5-bathroom townhome in Zara Villa's Condominium 
presents an unparalleled opportunity to embrace the Saint Lucian 
lifestyle, blending luxury, security, and the natural beauty of this 
Caribbean gem. Seize the chance to make this exquisite property 
your own and embark on a journey of tropical splendor in Saint 
Lucia.
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