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Villa Beau Soleil, Oyster Pond
Price:  USD 960.000

Location:  Oyster Pond

Bathrooms:  3

Bedrooms:  4

Lot size:  1.303 m2

Introducing a stunningly renovated 4-bedroom Oceanview villa, 
offering breathtaking panoramic views of the Atlantic ocean 
overlooking St Barths. Located in a prestigious gated community 
with 24-hour security, this property combines luxury with peace of 
mind. The home features a sleek, modern design with high-end 
finishes throughout, spacious bedrooms, and an open-concept 
living area that flows seamlessly to the outdoors. The spacious 
terrace has a private infinity pool and jacuzzi overlooking the 
endless ocean horizon, creating an oasis of relaxation and 
tranquility.  Perfect for those seeking an upscale coastal lifestyle, 
this property is the epitome of refined elegance and comfort. 
Looking for a investment property?  This stunning investment 
opportunity offers the perfect blend of luxury, comfort, and 
convenience, making it an ideal choice for both long-term and 
short-term rentals. Located in a prime neighborhood, this property 
boasts modern amenities and an inviting design that appeals to a 
wide range of tenants. Key Features: - Prime Location: Located in a 
vibrant, highly safe gated community area with excellent access to 
local attractions, dining, shopping, and beaches ( approx. 15 
minutes from Philipsburg and Orient beach). - Spacious Layout: The 
property features 4 bedrooms and 3 & 1/2 bathrooms, designed 
with an open-concept living space, perfect for families or groups 
looking for a comfortable stay. - Modern Amenities: Equipped with 
state-of-the-art appliances, private pool & jacuzzi, a fully furnished 
kitchen, and a stylishly decorated interior, this property caters to 
the needs of today's discerning renters. - Outdoor Space: A large 
private patio with pool and jacuzzi /garden/balcony provides a 
serene escape, adding significant appeal for short-term vacationers 
and long-term tenants alike. - Low Maintenance: Recent 
renovations/upgrades, including brand new A/C units, upgraded 
outdoor terrace, new furniture's etc. , mean minimal maintenance 
costs, ensuring a hassle-free investment. Whether you're looking to 
capitalize on the booming family home, short-term rental market or 
 long-term rental income, this property offers an exceptional 
opportunity to maximize your investment. Don't miss out on 
owning this prime piece of real estate! GET IN TOUCH TODAY! 
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