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Porto Cupecoy 3B/R Apartments
Price:  USD 4.000

Location:  Cupecoy

Bathrooms:  3

Bedrooms:  3

Porto Cupecoy is a nearly 20-acre mixed-use luxury condominium 
community with a full-service marina, a vibrant plaza filled with 
quaint shops and fine restaurants, and an array of world-class 
amenities. An oasis of sweet-scented breezes, gentle slopes and 
azure waters, Porto Cupecoy is nestled in a stunning cove on 
Simpson Bay Lagoon. Perfectly placed on the Dutch side of St. 
Maarten, the renowned culinary, shopping and yachting capital of 
the Caribbean, this Riviera inspired condominium village is artfully 
crafted for adventurous play, luxurious living and pure pleasure. 
Indulge your senses and appetite in casual cafés, gourmet grocers, 
fine restaurants and neighborhood bistros where everything is 
served with a generous helping of island hospitality. Apartments 
have been thoughtfully and luxuriously considered. A blend of 
utilitarian and luxuriant elements promises a peek at 3 bedrooms 
units designed for refined living and ease of intimacy. Gourmet 
kitchens of rich wood cabinetry, granite counter tops and stainless-
steel appliances ensure joyful entertaining. Spa-like baths boast 
Travertine tiled showers, soaking tubs and marble counters. Private 
covered terraces, a pool and gardens, bring a sense of the wild 
indoors and the energy of your inner life out. Prices start at $4,000 
based on location of unit, offering a very wide range of amenities. 
Communal pool, lush gardens, fitness center 24/7 security, 
restaurants, spa, hair salon, tennis court, boutiques, supermarket, 
assigned parking and generators. Private slips are available for the 
avid marine sports enthusiast.   The very best of resort and village 
life. Privacy and pleasure beyond measure. A life and place worth 
longing for.  No pets allowed. 2 months deposit + 1st. month's rents 
+ utilities For pricing and more information, please contact Debbie 
at 721-587-2813 or djones@kwsintmaarten.com. No pets allowed. 2 
months deposit + 1st. month's rents + utilities
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